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GRIN Verlag. Paperback. Book Condition: New. Paperback. 36
pages. Dimensions: 8.5in. x 5.5in. x 0.1in.Seminar paper from the
year 2005 in the subject Politics - International Politics - Topic:
Miscellaneous, grade: A, Concordia University Montreal, course:
BA Politics, 29 entries in the bibliography, language: English,
comment: Double spaced , abstract: The development of
Christianity in Sri Lanka has been a long and complex process.
Christianity has been instrumental in the development of
modern Sri Lankan politics and culture. In this paper I will
attempt to map the development of Christianity on the island
and assess its resultant political implications. I will also attempt
to prove that Christianity has played a major role in the political
development of present day Sri Lankan democracy. I.
Background Christian development in Sri Lanka could have
started as early as AD c. 50 when, according to legend, St.
Thomas the Apostle set foot upon the island to preach the
message of the gospels. 1 Since then, Sri Lanka has experienced
several stages of Christian development- which can be loosely
mapped as a transition from Roman Catholicism to Modern
Denominationalism- primarily orchestrated by the ruling power
that happened to be enjoying occupation of the island at...
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